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Council Meeting Date: 2/4/14

Due Date to Accounting: 1/28/14

REFUNDS
[Registrant Address Class: Session: Paid TOTAL REFUND
Jennifer Marisi 1725 Maple Ave Apt A Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 BrickHouse Winter 2014 | $35.00 $35.00
Cathy Zobel 218 Hawthorne Ave Haddonfield, NJ 08033 Pilates & Yoga Winter 2014 | $95.00 $95.00
Jennifer 0'Toole 1636 Oak Ave Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Acting for Beginners Winter 2014 [ $30.00 $30.00
Pam Whitaker 1027 Sycamore Street Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Low Impact Winter 2014 | 5$65.00 $65.00
Margie Kent 115 9th Ave Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Low Impact Winter 2014 | S$60.00 $60.00
Rosemary DiDonato 1317 Maple Ave Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Low impact Winter 2014 | 5$60.00 $60.00
Barbara MclLane 34 North Prive Haddonfield, NJ 08033 Gentle Yoga Winter 2014 | $55.00 $55.00
Maria Gallara 30 8th Ave Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Gentle (minus Pilates) Winter 2014 | 50-35= 15 $15.00
Carol Haddix 1001 Sycamore Street Haddon Heights, N) 08035 Gentle Yoga Winter 2014 | $50.00 $50.00
Chris Newell 1316 Sylvan Drive Haddon Heights, NJ 08035 Gentle Yoga (Chris & daughter) | Winter 2014 | $100.00 $100.00
Tracy Stiefel 40 Upland Way Haddonfield, NJ 08003 Gentle Yoga Winter 2014 | $55.00 $55.00
Patty Principato 115 North Drive Haddonfield, NJ 08003 Gentle Yoga Winter 2014 | $55.00 $55.00
Deborah Dekoski 29 North Drive Haddonfield, NJ 08003 Gentle Yoga Winter 2014 | $55.00 $55.00
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BID A41-13
OFFICE SUPPLIES JANUARY 2014

2009 VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
BID A 41-13 WB MASON | OFFICE BASICS, ONLINE '
PURCHASE OF OFFIiCE SUPPLIES CO., INC. INC TECHSTORES '
BID BOND N/A N/A N/A
CONSENT OF SURETY N/A N/A N/A
CERTIFICATE OF OWNERSHIP oK OK OK
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT OK 0K oK
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION OK 0K OK
DEBARMENT oK OK 0K
BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK oK OK
HIGHEST PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT 78.40% 85% NO BID
OF CATALOG ITEMS INCLUDED
HIGHEST PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT 43.90% 40% NO BID
OF ITEMS NOT INCLUDED
ELECTRONICS ONLY 36% 27% NO BID
CALCULATORS & PENCIL SHARPENERS
COMPUTER RELATED SUPPLIES 39.50% 31% NO BID
$44.00 LIST & UNDER '




BID A41-13

OFFICE SUPPLIES JANUARY 2014

TONER/INK
BROTHER ink 31% 29% 0%
BROTHER toner 36% 32% 0%
CANON Ink 31% 21% 0%
CANON toner 36% 32% 0%
DELL 31% 4% 0%
EPSON ink 31% 18% 0%
EPSON toner 3% 18% 0%
HP ink 38% 31% 0%
HP toner 43% 39% 0%
LEXMARK ink 41% 24% 0%
LEXMARK toner 36% 34% 0%
MURATEC 41% 24% 0%
OKIDATA 41% 28% 0%
PANASONIC 41% 14% 0%
RICOH 41% 10% 0%
- SAMSUNG 41% 29% 0%
SHARP 41% 27% 0%
XEROX Ink 31% 26% 0%
XEROX toner 31% 26% 0%
INK REMANUFACTURED
HP ink & toner 46% 60% 10%
Ail other Brands 41% 20% 10%
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